
Wayne-Finger Lakes BOCES
Cooperative HVAC Filters Boiler Maintenance Kits
WFL 2022-57

Supplies Catalog Effective:
 02/01/2022 - 01/31/2023

1

2 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 5 EACH No Bid

3 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH No Bid

4 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH No Bid

5 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH No Bid

6 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH No Bid

7

8 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 4 EACH $261.00 $1,044.00 58015-01 1 Yes

9 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $661.00 $661.00 58015-03 1 Yes

BOILER MAINTENANCE KITS -AERCO

AERCO Boiler 12 Month Low Nox Maintenance Kit, 58015-01

AERCO Boiler 24 Month 2.0 LN Maintenance Kit, 58015-03

BOILER MAINTENANCE KITS - Fulton

Fulton Boiler Maintenance Kit Standard, 4-50-SP0403

Fulton Boiler Maintenance Kit Extended, 4-50-SP0404

Fulton Boiler Maintenance Kit Extended w/Flame Rod, 4-50-SP0408

Fulton Boiler Maintenance Kit Standard, 4-50-SP0405

Fulton Boiler Maintenance Kit Extended, 4-50-SP0406



Wayne-Finger Lakes BOCES
Cooperative HVAC Filters Boiler Maintenance Kits
WFL 2022-57

Supplies Catalog Effective:
 02/01/2022 - 01/31/2023

10 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 3 EACH $435.00 $1,305.00 58025-1 1 Yes

11 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $326.00 $326.00 124930 1 Yes

12 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 3 EACH $746.00 $2,238.00 58025-05 1 Yes

13 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $773.00 $773.00 58025-06 1 Yes

14 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $621.00 $621.00 58015-02 1 Yes

15 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $665.00 $665.00 58015-06 1 Yes

16

17 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $2.34 $46.80 N/A 1 Yes

18 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 4 EACH $2.41 $9.64 N/A 1 Yes

AERCO Boiler 24 Month 2.0 LN Maintenance Kit, 58025-06

AERCO Boiler 24 Month 2.0 Nozzle Mix Maintenance Kit, 58015-02

AERCO Boiler 24 Month 2.0 LN Maintenance Kit, 58015-06

FILTERS - Fiberglass

Fiberglass Filters 8 x 18 7/8 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 8 x 28 x 1

AERCO Boiler 12 Month Low Nox Maintenance Kit, 58025-01

AERCO Boiler 12 Month 2.0 Nozzle Mix Maintenance Kit, 124930

AERCO Boiler 24 Month 1.5 LN Maintenance Kit, 58025-05
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19 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 4 EACH $2.41 $9.64 TBD 1 Yes

20 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 4 EACH $2.47 $9.88 TBD 1 Yes

21 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 22 EACH $2.47 $54.34 TBD 1 Yes

22 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $2.47 $2.47 TBD 1 Yes

23 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 24 EACH $2.47 $59.28 TBD 1 Yes

24 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $2.47 $49.40 TBD 1 Yes

25 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $2.47 $49.40 TBD 1 Yes

26 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $2.94 $58.80 TBD 1 Yes

27 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $7.04 $140.80 TBD 1 Yes

Fiberglass Filters 9 1/2 x 35 1/2 x 1/2

Fiberglass Filters 9 1/2 x 45 1/2 x 1/2

Fiberglass Filters 9 1/2 x 55 1/2 x 1/2

Fiberglass Filters 8 1/4 x 27 3/4 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 8 1/4 x 43 7/8 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 8 7/8 x 33 5/8 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 8 7/8 x 42 1/8 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 9 1/4 x 33 3/4 x 1/2

Fiberglass Filters 9 1/2 x 27 1/2 x 1/2
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28 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $7.76 $155.20 TBD 1 Yes

29 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 168 EACH $2.47 $414.96 TBD 1 Yes

30 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 24 EACH $2.47 $59.28 TBD 1 Yes

31 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 24 EACH $2.47 $59.28 TBD 1 Yes

32 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 12 EACH $2.51 $30.12 N/A 1 Yes

33 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 24 EACH $2.47 $59.28 TBD 1 Yes

34 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 28 EACH $2.47 $69.16 N/A 1 Yes

35 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 6 EACH $2.47 $14.82 TBD 1 Yes

36 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 45 EACH $2.94 $132.30 TBD 1 Yes

Fiberglass Filters 9 3/4 x 37 1/4 x 1/2

Fiberglass Filters 10 x 20 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 10 x 26 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 10 x 36 1/2 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 10 x 36 3/8 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 10 x 48 1/2 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 9 1/2 x 65 1/2 x 1/2

Pleated Filters 9 3/4 x 25 3/4 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 9 3/4 x 29 1/4 x 1/2
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37 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 18 EACH $2.94 $52.92 TBD 1 Yes

38 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 14 EACH $7.76 $108.64 TBD 1 Yes

39 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 10 EACH $7.76 $77.60 TBD 1 Yes

40 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 17 EACH $7.81 $132.77 TBD 1 Yes

41 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 12 EACH $2.51 $30.12 tbd 1 Yes

42 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 30 EACH $3.47 $104.10 TBD 1 Yes

43 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 18 EACH $7.76 $139.68 TBD 1 Yes

44 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 6 EACH $7.76 $46.56 TBD 1 Yes

45 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $7.04 $140.80 N/A 1 Yes

Fiberglass Filters 12 x 54 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 12 x 54 3/4 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 13 3/8 x 41 1/2 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 10 x 48 3/8 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 10 x 60 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 10 x 60 3/8 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 10 x 72 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 12 x 24 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 12 x 43 3/4 x 1
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Cooperative HVAC Filters Boiler Maintenance Kits
WFL 2022-57

Supplies Catalog Effective:
 02/01/2022 - 01/31/2023

46 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 60 EACH $7.81 $468.60 TBD 1 Yes

47 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $7.90 $158.00 TBD 1 Yes

48 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $8.17 $163.40 TBD 1 Yes

49 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 2 EACH $2.34 $4.68 TBD 1 Yes

50 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 50 EACH $2.92 $146.00 TBD 1 Yes

51 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 172 EACH $2.94 $505.68 TBD 1 Yes

52 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $13.29 $13.29 TBD 1 Yes

53 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $13.29 $13.29 TBD 1 Yes

54 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 82 EACH $2.71 $222.22 TBD 1 Yes

Fiberglass Filters 14 x 14 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 14 x 24 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 14 x 30 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 15 x 77 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 15 1/2 x 78 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 16 x 20 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 13 3/8 x 53 1/2 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 13 3/8 x 65 1/2 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 13 3/8 x 77 1/2 x 1



Wayne-Finger Lakes BOCES
Cooperative HVAC Filters Boiler Maintenance Kits
WFL 2022-57
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 02/01/2022 - 01/31/2023

55 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 26 EACH $2.71 $70.46 TBD 1 Yes

56 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 360 EACH $2.90 $1,044.00 TBD 1 Yes

57 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 444 EACH $2.71 $1,203.24 TBD 1 Yes

58 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 48 EACH $2.71 $130.08 TBD 1 Yes

59 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 48 EACH $2.71 $130.08 TBD 1 Yes

60 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 312 EACH $3.07 $957.84 TBD 1 Yes

61 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 168 EACH $3.07 $515.76 TBD 1 Yes

62

63 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 12 EACH $2.86 $34.32 TBD 1 Yes

Fiberglass Filters 24 x 24 x 2

FILTERS - Pleated

Pleated Filters 10 x 20 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 16 x 25 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 16 x 20 x 2

Fiberglass Filters 16 x 25 x 2

Fiberglass Filters 18 x 24 x 1

Fiberglass Filters 20 x 20 x 2

Fiberglass Filters 20 x 24 x 2



Wayne-Finger Lakes BOCES
Cooperative HVAC Filters Boiler Maintenance Kits
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64 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 10 EACH $10.37 $103.70 tbd 1 Yes

65 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 18 EACH $12.35 $222.30 TBD 1 Yes

66 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 4 EACH $18.12 $72.48 TBD 1 Yes

67 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 32 EACH $10.61 $339.52 TBD 1 Yes

68 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 36 EACH $5.62 $202.32 TBD 1 Yes

69 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 24 EACH $3.33 $79.92 TBD 1 Yes

70 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 64 EACH $3.57 $228.48 TBD 1 Yes

71 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 44 EACH $6.52 $286.88 TBD 1 Yes

72 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $18.67 $18.67 TBD 1 Yes

Pleated Filters 11 7/8 x 24 7/8 x 2

Pleated Filters 12 x 20 x 2

Pleated Filters 12 x 24 x 1

Pleated Filters 12 x 24 x 2

Pleated Filters 12 x 24 x 4

Pleated Filters 13 1/2 x 53 1/2 x 1

Pleated Filters 10 x 36 1/2 x 1

Pleated Filters 10 x 48 3/8 x 1

Pleated Filters 10 x 60 x 1
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73 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 8 EACH $14.24 $113.92 TBD 1 Yes

74 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 4 EACH $21.36 $85.44 TBD 1 Yes

75 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 29 EACH $3.75 $108.75 TBD 1 Yes

76 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 4 EACH $26.54 $106.16 TBD 1 Yes

77 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 64 EACH $3.26 $208.64 TBD 1 Yes

78 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 179 EACH $3.80 $680.20 TBD 1 Yes

79 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 28 EACH $7.42 $207.76 TBD 1 Yes

80 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 96 EACH $4.37 $419.52 TBD 1 Yes

81 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 163 EACH $4.37 $712.31 TBD 1 Yes

Pleated Filters 16 x 20 x 4

Pleated Filters 16 x 24 x 1

Pleated Filters 16 x 24 x 2

Pleated Filters 13 3/8 x 41 1/2 x 1

Pleated Filters 13 3/8 x 65 1/2 x 1

Pleated Filters 14 x 20 x 2

Pleated Filters 15 1/4 x 77 1/2 x 1

Pleated Filters 16 x 20 x 1

Pleated Filters 16 x 20 x 2
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82 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 96 EACH $3.84 $368.64 TBD 1 Yes

83 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 178 EACH $4.38 $779.64 TBD 1 Yes

84 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 48 EACH $8.37 $401.76 TBD 1 Yes

85 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 12 EACH $18.12 $217.44 TBD 1 Yes

86 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 36 EACH $3.85 $138.60 TBD 1 Yes

87 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 98 EACH $4.85 $475.30 TBD 1 Yes

88 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 4 EACH $9.51 $38.04 TBD 1 Yes

89 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 74 EACH $14.24 $1,053.76 TBD 1 Yes

90 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 46 EACH $3.72 $171.12 TBD 1 Yes

Pleated Filters 16 x 41 x 1

Pleated Filters 18 x 24 x 1

Pleated Filters 18 x 24 x 2

Pleated Filters 18 x 24 x 4

Pleated Filters 19 x 27 x 1

Pleated Filters 20 x 20 x 1

Pleated Filters 16 x 25 x 1

Pleated Filters 16 x 25 x 2

Pleated Filters 16 x 25 x 4
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91 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 239 EACH $4.38 $1,046.82 TBD 1 Yes

92 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 96 EACH $8.37 $803.52 TBD 1 Yes

93 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 590 EACH $4.62 $2,725.80 TBD 1 Yes

94 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 122 EACH $4.85 $591.70 TBD 1 Yes

95 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 16 EACH $7.93 $126.88 TBD 1 Yes

96 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $12.35 $247.00 TBD 1 Yes

97 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 236 EACH $5.55 $1,309.80 TBD 1 Yes

98 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 156 EACH $10.32 $1,609.92 TBD 1 Yes

99 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 124 EACH $6.06 $751.44 TBD 1 Yes

Pleated Filters 24 x 24 x 2

Pleated Filters 24 x 24 x 4

Pleated Filters 25 x 25 x 2

Pleated Filters 20 x 20 x 2

Pleated Filters 20 x 20 x 4

Pleated Filters 20 x 24 x 2

Pleated Filters 20 x 25 x 2

Pleated Filters 20 x 30 x 2

Pleated Filters 21 x 21 x 1
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100

101 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $175.64 $175.64 TBD 1 Yes

102 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 1 EACH $147.38 $147.38 TBD 1 Yes

103 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 24 EACH $54.02 $1,296.48 TBD 1 Yes

104 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 50 EACH $2.23 $111.50 TBD 1 Yes

105 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 28 EACH $62.24 $1,742.72 TBD 1 Yes

106 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 20 EACH $45.10 $902.00 TBD 1 Yes

107 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 64 EACH $42.17 $2,698.88 TBD 1 Yes

108 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 50 EACH $10.37 $518.50 TBD 1 Yes

Hi-Flo Bag Filter Series III - 10 Pockets, 24 x 24 x 12

Fiber Glass Pad - No Frame, 25 x 25 x 1

Merv 13, 2V Box Filter W/Header, Fiberglass Media, 12 x 24 x 12

Pocket Filters, Merv 9, 5 Pockets, 24 x 20 x 16

Pocket Filters, Merv 9, 6 Pockets, 24 x 24 x 16

Univents Inside Pleated Filter, 10 x 36 x 1

MISCELLANEOUS - Filters  Related Items

EDCO Paint Booth Exhaust Filter, 24 x 300, Type AG Fiberglass Roll

EDCO Dust Collector Cartridge Filter, 13 Dia x 32 L, Clark P/N EDCO 1567069
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109 Vendor Item Number Unit Pack Size As Specified
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
R.P. Fedder Corporation 8 EACH $6.24 $49.92 TBD 1 Yes

Wire Re-Enforced Filters, 20 x 20 x 1
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