Milk, Dairy Products and Juices WFL 2021-11 Bid

Supplies Catalog
September 1, 2020 through August 31, 2021

| 2 |1% Low Fat Chocolate Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier Qry uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 163500 EACH $0.33 $53,955.00

| 3 |Fat Free Chocolate Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier Qrty uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 40000 EACH $0.3225 $12,900.00

| 4 |Fat Free Strawberry Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier Qrty uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 48500 EACH $0.33 $16,005.00

| 5 |1% Low Fat Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier Qrty uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 255540 EACH $0.33 $84,328.20

| 8 |White Skim Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier Qrty uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 46000 EACH $0.32 $14,720.00

| 9 |1% Low Fat Chocolate Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier Qry uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 255000 EACH $0.291 $74,205.00

| 10 |Fat Free Chocolate Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier Qrty uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 81000 EACH $0.2785 $22,558.50

| 11 |1% Low Fat Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier Qrty uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 35000 EACH $0.272 $9,520.00
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| 14 |Homogenized Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QrYy Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 300 EACH $0.2955 $88.65

| 15 |white Skim Milk, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 103000 EACH $0.261 $26,883.00

16 oz PLASTIC BOTTLES, 2% Low Fat Milk, Low Fat Chocolate, Low Fat Strawberry, Intense Chocolate,, Capuccino (Mocha or Vanilla),
17 |Mocha, Vanilla, Mint Chocolate Chip, plus any periodic special flavors. PLEASE LIST ALL FLAVORS AVAILABLE. 3 Day Delivery - Base
Bid/Firm Pricing

Supplier QTrYy Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
WHOLE MILK, 2%, SKIM, INTENSE
CHOCOLATE, INTENSE VAN, INTENSE
LF STRAW, LF VAN CAPPUCCINO,
MINT CHOC CHIP (SEASONAL),
INTENSE PUMPKIN SPICE (SEASONAL),
INTENSE COOKIES & CREAM

Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 1000 EACH $1.09 $1,090.00 (SEASONAL)

| 24 |1% Low Fat Milk, Gallon, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing

Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 560 EACH $3.85 $2,156.00

| 26 |2% Low Fat Milk, Gallon, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing

Supplier QrYy uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 10 EACH $3.98 $39.80

| 27 |Homogenized Milk, Gallon, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing

Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 48 EACH S4.05 $194.40
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16 oz PLASTIC BOTTLES, 2% Low Fat Milk, Low Fat Chocolate, Low Fat Strawberry, Intense Chocolate,, Capuccino (Mocha or Vanilla),

28 |Mocha, Vanilla, Mint Chocolate Chip, plus any periodic special flavors. PLEASE LIST ALL FLAVORS AVAILABLE. 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1
Price Adjust.
Supplier QTy uUoM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
(CROSSED OFF MOCHA IN THE BID
SPEC) WHOLE MILK, 2%, SKIM,
INTENSE CHOCOLATE, INTENSE VAN,
INTENSE LF STRAW, LF VAN
CAPPUCCINO, MINT CHOC CHIP
(SEASONAL), INTENSE PUMPKIN SPICE
(SEASONAL), INTENSE COOKIES &
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 5000 EACH $0.99 $4,950.00 CREAM (SEASONAL)
| 34 |1% Low Fat Milk, Gallon, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTrY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 150 EACH $3.32 $498.00
| 37 |Homogenized Milk, Gallon, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTrYy Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 48 EACH $3.75 $180.00
| 38 |Skim Milk, Gallon, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 20 EACH $3.22 $64.40
| 40 |Buttermi|k, Quart, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTrY uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 1220 EACH $1.18 $1,439.60
| 42 |4% Cottage Cheese, Small Curd, 5 Pound, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 9 EACH $9.20 $82.80
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| 43 |Cottage Cheese - Low Fat, Small Curd, 5 Pound, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing

Supplier QrYy Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 109 EACH $9.20 $1,002.80

| 44 |Sour Cream, 5 Pound, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 900 EACH $9.50 $8,550.00

| 45 |Sour Cream, 1 Pound, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTrY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 30 EACH $1.98 $59.40

| 47 |Yogurt - Flavored, Variety, 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QrY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 2430 EACH S0.32 $777.60

| 48 |Yogurt - Fat Free Flavored Variety, 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 64600 EACH S0.32 $20,672.00

| 49 |Dari Ease, 1/2 pint, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 40 EACH No Bid

| 50 |Greek Yogart - Plain, 2 Ibs, Each, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 10 EACH $3.29 $32.90

| 52 |Yogurt No Fat, 8 oz, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 2950 EACH S0.65 $1,917.50
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| 53 |Yogart - Vanilla, 5lbs, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing

Supplier QrYy Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 190 EACH $5.35 $1,016.50

| 54 |Yogart - Strawberry, 5lbs, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 85 EACH $5.30 $450.50

| 56 |Yogurt - Flavored, Variety, 8 oz, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTrY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 15 EACH S0.65 $9.75

| 58 |Non-Dairy Creamer, 402 ct., 3/8 oz each, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QrY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 5 BOX $10.55 $52.75

| 59 |Ha|f Half - Fat Free, QT, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 280 EACH No Bid

| 60 |Lactaid, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 10088 EACH $0.80 $8,070.40

| 65 |Greek Yogart - Plain, 2 |bs, Each, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 400 EACH $2.99 $1,196.00

| 66 |Greek Yogart - Vanilla, 2 Ibs, Each, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 200 EACH $2.99 $598.00
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| 67 |Dari Ease, 1/2 pint, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QrYy Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 1000 EACH No Bid

| 68 |Yogurt - Fat Free Flavored Variety, 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QrYy Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 13100 EACH $0.292 $3,825.20

| 70 |Ha|f amp; Half - Fat Free, QT, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 120 EACH No Bid

| 71 |Buttermi|k, Quart, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTrY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 2315 EACH $1.0755 $2,489.78

| 73 |4% Cottage Cheese, Small Curd, 5 Pound, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 10 EACH $7.69 $76.90

| 74 |Cottage Cheese - Low Fat, Small Curd, 5 Pound, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 20 EACH $7.69 $153.80

| 77 |Sour Cream, 5 Pound, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 228 EACH $7.75 $1,767.00

| 78 |Yogart - Flavored, Variety, 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.
Supplier QTrYy uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 6000 EACH $0.292 $1,752.00
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| 79 |Plain Non-Fat Yogart, 5 Ibs, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QrYy Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 75 EACH S4.50 $337.50

| 80 |Yogart No Fat, 8 oz, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 2000 EACH S0.57 $1,140.00

| 81 |Yogart - Vanilla, 5lbs, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QTrY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 1360 EACH S4.97 $6,759.20

| 82 |Yogart - Strawberry, 5 Ibs, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QrY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 245 EACH S4.85 $1,188.25

| 84 |Yogart - Flavored, Variety, 8 oz, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 20 EACH S0.57 $11.40

| 87 |Lactaid, 1/2 Pint Carton, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 2595 EACH S0.75 $1,946.25

| 90 |Juice - Apple, Orange, Grape (Purple Only), 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing

Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 81450 EACH $0.2056 $16,746.12

100% Fruit Juice, 4 oz. Cup, (Note to Bidder: Specify Brands/Juice Available), 3 Day Delivery - Base Bid/Firm Pricing, 3 Day Delivery - Base

a1 Bid/Firm Pricing
Supplier Qrty uom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 30 EACH $0.1882 $5.65
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| 101|100% Fruit Juice, 4 oz. Cup, (Note to bidder: Specify Brands/Juice Available) 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QrYy Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 200 EACH $0.1875 $37.50

| 102|Juice - Apple, Orange, Grape (Purple Only), 4 oz, 3 Day Delivery - Alt. No. 1 Price Adjust.

Supplier QTY Uuom Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Upstate Niagara Cooperative, Inc. 103580 EACH $0.2031 $21,037.10
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