WAYNE - FINGER LAKES

Board of Cooperative Educational Services

WFL 2021-15 Vendor Bid Listing
NYS Industries for the Disabled
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: WEFL 2021-15 Vendor Bid Listing

Title: Cooperative Cafeteria, Paper, Supplies & Cleaning Products
Type: Request for Bid

Issue Date: 8/11/2020

Deadline:  8/11/2020 03:15 PM (ET)

Contact Information

Contact: Linda McClean
Address: Purchasing
Eisenhower
131 Drumlin Court.
Newark, NY 14513
Phone: 315 (332) 7458
Fax: 315 (332) 7409
Email: WFLPurchasing@wflboces.org
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NYS Industries for the Disabled Information

Contact: Sean Coons
Address: 11 Columbia Circle Drive

Albany, NY 12203

Phone:  (518) 463-9706

Fax: (518) 455-0315
Toll Free: (518) 463-9706
Email: scoons@nysid.org

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company.

SEAN COONS

SCOONS@NYSID.ORG

Signature Email
Submitted at 8/12/2020 6:00:00 PM

Bid Lines

1

Bags, Clear Plastic, Submarine, 4 x 2 x 12, 1000/case
Quantity: 110 UOM: Case

No Bid

Bags, Clear Plastic Storage, 6 x 3 x 15, 1000/case
Quantity: 144 UOM: Case

No Bid

Reclosable Sandwich Bag 6 x 6, .0012 gauge, 1000/case
Quantity: _12  UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer: |Elkay or equal

Manufacturer #: |#1368003

Bags, Clear Plastic Storage, 8 x 4 x 18, 1000/case
Quantity: 51 UOM: Case

No Bid

Bags, Freezer, 10 x 14, 1000/case
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: Case

No Bid

Bags, Meat & Poultry, 12 x 8 x 30, 500/case
Quantity: 35 UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer: |Tenneco

Bags, Meat & Poultry, 10 x 8 x 24, 500/case
Quantity: 95 UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer: | Tenneco

Bags, Meat & Poultry, 8 x 4 x 18, 500/case
Quantity: 26 UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer: |Tenneco
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Bags, Bun Tray (Plastic) with Twist Ties, 27 x 37, 200/Roll

Quantity: 120 UOM: Roll No Bid
Bags, Sandwich, Clear Saddle Pack, 6 1/2 x 7, 2000/case
Quantity: 356 UOM: Case No Bid
Bags, Gusset Bag 8 x 3 x 15", 1000/case 240
Quantity: _30 UOM: Case No Bid
Bags, Sandwich, Poly w/2 Flap, 7 x 7 x 1/4, 1000/case
Quantity: 28 UOM: Case No Bid
Bags, Brown Paper #6, 500/pkg.
Quantity: 191 UOM: Package No Bid
Bags, Candy & Nuts Bag, Palin bag, bleached kraft, 1/2 Ib capacity, 1000/case
Quantity: _ 5 UOM: Case No Bid
Bags, Printed Cookie Flip Top Saddle Pack Deli Bag, Printed with Cookie Bag in one color, 5 1/2 X 5 1/2,
2000/case
Quantity: _49 UOM: Case No Bid
Bags, Brown Kraft #12, 2/500 ct.
Quantity: 59 UOM: Case No Bid
Can Liners, Clear, 46 Gallon, 250/case
Quantity: _56  UOM: Case No Bid
Cleanser, Liquid w/Bleach, 8/32 oz. Bottles
Quantity: 40 UOM: Case No Bid
Manufacturer: |Comet |
Item Notes: 32205
Bleach, 6/1 gal./case
Quantity: 81 UOM: Case No Bid
Manufacturer: |Clorox or equiv. |
Cleanser, Liquid w/Bleach, 8/32 oz. Bottles
Quantity: _46 UOM: Case No Bid
Manufacturer: |Comet |
Ajax Cleanser, 24/case, 21 oz.
Quantity: _ 9 UOM: Case No Bid
Lime-A-Way, 4/1 gal.

No Bid

Quantity: 139 UOM: Case

Manufacturer: |Ecolab or equal
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2 | Dish Cloths, 13 x 24, 150/case
Quantity: 127  UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer: |Chicopee

2 | Stainless Steel Scrubber, 12/case
Quantity: 137 UOM: Case

No Bid

2 | Scour Pads, Green, 60/case

Quantity: 197 UOM: Case Unit Price:

$16.86 | Total: |

$3,321.42 |

Supplier Notes: [#D4701

2 | Scour Pads, Heavy Duty, 6 x 9, 10/pack

Quantity: 33 UOM: Package Unit Price:

$24.00| Total |

$792.00 |

Manufacturer: |R0yal S960

Supplier Notes: [#D4702 60/CS NYSID BRAND

2 | Scrubber Sponges, 8/5pkgs./case
Quantity: _ 2 UOM: Case

No Bid

2 | Micro Fiber Cleaning Towels, 14 x 14, 20/Pack

Quantity: 80 UOM: Package Unit Price:

$23.66| Total:|

$1,892.80 |

Supplier Notes: |#D4011 12/CS

2 | Liquid Dish Soap, 4 gal./case.

Quantity: 51 UOM: Case Unit Price:

$18.85| Total: |

$961.35 |

Supplier Notes: [#D04762

3 | PG Professional Dish Detergent, 8 - 320z/case
Quantity: _75 UOM: Case

No Bid

3 | Oven Cleaner, Aerosol, 16 oz. can, 12/case
Quantity: 25 UOM: Case

No Bid

3 | Paper Towels, 2 ply, Kitchen Roll, 30/case

Quantity: 76 UOM: Case Unit Price:

$26.09| Total: |

$1,082.84 |

Manufacturer: |Fort Howard

Manufacturer #: |#273

Supplier Notes:  [#D4420 MARCAL PRO

3 | Laminated Foil Wrap Cheeseburger 10.5 X 14, 2000/case
Quantity: _65 UOM: Case

No Bid

Laminated Foil Sheet - Blue Check 10.5 X 13, 2000/case
Quantity: 90 UOM: Case

W

No Bid
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Aluminum Foil, Standard, 12 x 500' roll

Quantity: _89  UOM: Roll No Bid
g Aluminum Foil, Standard, 18 x 1000 roll

Quantity: 110 UOM: Roll No Bid
3 [ Aluminum Foil, Standard, 24 x 1000’ roll
7 :

Quantity: _39  UOM: Roll No Bid
g Aluminum Foil, Heavy Duty, 18 x 500’ roll

Quantity: 91  UOM: Ruall No Bid
g Aluminum Wrap Sheets (Potato Wraps), 9 x 10, 6/500

Quantity: _53 UOM: Case No Bid
8 Foil Sheets, 12 x 10 3/4, 500/pkg, 6 pkgs./case

Quantity: 108 UOM: Case No Bid
il Plastic Film Wrap, 12 x 2000

Quantity: 242 UOM: Roll No Bid
g Plastic Film Wrap, 18 x 2000

Quantity: 273 UOM: Roll No Bid
él Plastic Film Wrap, 24 x 2000

Quantity: _31  UOM: Roll No Bid
j Plastic Film Wrap, 12 x 12 Perforated Sandwich Wrap, 1600 sq./roll

Quantity: 36 UOM: Ruoll No Bid
451 Baking Cups, cupcakes, 20/500ct.

Quantity: _ 3 UOM: Case No Bid
g Patty Papers, 24/1000/case

Quantity: _ 7 UOM: Case No Bid
471 Delicatessan Paper, 12 x 10 3/4, 500/box, 8 bxs/case

Quantity: _23  UOM: Case No Bid
g Pan Liner Paper Quilon, 16 1/2 x 24 1/2, 100/box

Quantity: 340 UOM: Box No Bid
4 | Waxed Paper, 12 x 700’ roll
? No Bid

Quantity: 44 UOM: Roll
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Coffee Filters, 500/case
Quantity: 6 UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer:  |Filtrator

Manufacturer #: |#203

Embossed Paper, Table Covering, 40' x 300" Roll
Quantity: _18 UOM: Roll

No Bid

Bowls, Foam, 12 oz. Curved, 1000/case
Quantity: _48 UOM: Case

No Bid

Bowls, Foam, 40z./5 oz. Dessert, 1000/case
Quantity: 133 UOM: Case

No Bid

~O1

Bowls, Squat Soup, 8 oz. Tall, 1000/case.
Quantity: 128 UOM: Case

No Bid

Lid for 8 oz Tall Squat Soup Bowl, Must fit bid line item #54, 1000/case.
Quantity: 92 UOM: Case

No Bid

Bowls, Squat Soup, 8 oz. Low, 1000/case

Quantity: 65 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

No Bid

Lid for 8 oz Low Squat Bowl, Must fit bid line item #56, 1000/case.

Quantity: 49 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

No Bid

Bowls, Squat Soup, 10 oz. Low, 1000/case

Quantity: 113 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

No Bid

Lid for 10 oz Low Squat Soup Bowl, Must fit bid line item #58, 1000/case.

Quantity: 87 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

No Bid

Bowls, Squat Soup, 12 oz. Low, 1000/case.

Quantity: 58 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

No Bid

Lid for 12 oz Low Squat Soup Bowl, Must fit bid line item #60, 1000/case.

Quantity: 52 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

No Bid
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Cups, Plastic Cold, 5 o0z., 2500/case.
Quantity: 93 UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer: | Fabrikal

Manufacturer #: |#20757

Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

Lids, Plastic Cold, Non-Vented, Must Fit line item #62, 5000/case

Quantity: 28 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

No Bid

Cups, Plastic Cold, 7 oz., 2500/case
Quantity: 24 UOM: Case

No Bid

Cups, Plastic Cold, 9 oz., 2500/case
Quantity: _14 UOM: Case

No Bid

Cups, 12 oz Plastic Translucent, 1000/case.

Quantity: 28 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

No Bid

Lid to fit 12 oz Plastic Translucent Cup, Must fit bid line item #66, 1000/case.

Quantity: 20 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

No Bid

Cups, Plastic Cold, 12 oz., 1000/case. Must fit with bid items #69 & #70

Quantity: 50 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

No Bid

Lid, Dome Without Hole, For use with 12 oz Plastic Cold Cup, 1000/case, Must fit with bid items #68 & #70.

Quantity: 47 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**
Insert for 12 oz Plastic Cold Cup, Must fit with bid items #68 & #69, 1000/case.
Quantity: 32 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**
Cups, Plastic Cold, 16 oz., 1000/case.
Quantity: 10 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**
Lid to fit 16 oz. Plastic Cold Cup, Must fit bid line item #71, 1000/case.
Quantity: 5 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**
Cups, Foam Coffee, 6 0z., 1000/case.

No Bid

Quantity: 11 UOM: Case
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**
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Z Lid to fit 6 0z Foam Coffee Cup, Must fit bid line item #73, 1000/case.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

g Cups, Foam Coffee, 8 0z., 1000/case.

Quantity: 22 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

g Lid to fit 8 0z Foam Coffee Cup, Must fit bid line item #75, 1000/case.

Quantity: 12 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

; Cups, Foam, 10 oz., 1000/case.

Quantity: 12 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

g Lids to fit 10 oz Foam Cup, Must fit bid line item #77, 1000/case.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

g Cups, Squat Foam, 4 oz., 1000/case.

Quantity: 70 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

8 Lids to fit 4 oz Squat Foam Cups, Must fit bid line item #79, 1000/case.

Quantity: 60 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

? Clear Squat Cup - 12/14 oz, Must fit with bid line items #82 & #83, 1000/case.

Quantity: 75 UOM: Case No Bid
Manufacturer: | Fabri-Kal |
Manufacturer #: |KC123 |
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

523 Insert - 4 oz to fit 12/14 oz Clear Squat Cup, Must fit with bid line items #81 & #83, 1000/case.

Quantity: 71  UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

% Lids, Dome Without Hole to fit 12/14 oz Clear Squat Cup, Must fit with bid line items #81 & #82, 1000/case.
Quantity: 75 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

2 Cups, Squat Foam Cup, 6 oz., 1000/case.

Quantity: 10 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**
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Clear Squat Cup - 12/14 oz, 1000/Case, See bid specifications for award information, SAMPLE REQUIRED
Quantity: _16  UOM: Case No Bid

Manufacturer: |Fabri-Kal KC12S |
Item Notes: 32707

Insert - 4 oz to fit 12/14 oz Clear Squat Cup, Must fit bid item #32707, 1000/case, See bid specifications for
award information, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Quantity: 11 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: 32708

Lids, Dome Without Hole to fit 12/14 oz Clear Squat Cup, Must fit bid item #32707, 1000/case, See bid
specifications for award information, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Quantity: 12 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: 32709

Disposable Paper French Fry Cups, 9 0z Grease Resistant, 2000/case.
Quantity: 54 UOM: Case No Bid

Lids to Fit 6 0z. Squat Foam Cup, Must fit bid item #32715, 1000/case, See bid specifications for award
information, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Quantity: 7 UOM: Case No Bid

Item Notes: 32720

Cups, Paper Souffle Cup, 2 oz., 5000/case.
Quantity: _ 2 UOM: Case No Bid

Lids, to fit 120z. Squat Foam Cup, Must fit bid item #32727, 1000/case, See bid specifications for award
information, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Quantity: 2 UOM: Case No Bid

Item Notes: 32728

Cups, Plastic Souffle Cup, 1 oz., 5000/case.

Quantity: 55 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

Lids, Plastic to Fit 1 oz. Souffle Cup, Must fit bid line item #92, 5000/case.

Quantity: 41 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

Cups, Plastic Souffle Cup, 2 oz., 2500/case.

Quantity: 240 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

Lids, Plastic, Non-Vented to fit 2 oz. Souffle Cup, Must fit bid line item #94, 2500/case.

Quantity: 175 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**
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g Cups, Plastic Souffle Cup, 4 0z., 2400/case.
Quantity: 396 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

% Lids, Plastic Souffle to fit 4 oz. Souffle Cup, Must fit bid item #96, 2500/case.
Quantity: 339 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

593 Cups, Plastic Souffle Cup, 5.5 0z., 2400/case.
Quantity: 155 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

8 Lid to fit 5.5 oz Plastic Souffle Cup, Must fit bid line item #98, 2400/case.
Quantity: 83 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

% Hoagie Container, Clear Plastic, 8 1/2 x 4 x 2 1/2, 200/Case.

0 | Quantity: 64 UOM: Case No Bid
Manufacturer: |Pactiv or Equivalent |

1 | Clear Deli Container, 32 oz., 500/case.

0 _ .

1 | Quantity: 64 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

% Clear Deli Lid, 32 oz., Must fit bid line item #101, 500/case.

2 [ Quantity: 4 UOM: Case No Bid
Item Notes: *See bid specifications for award information *SAMPLE REQUIRED**

% Clear Plastic Hinged Container, Smart Lock, 9 1/4 x 6 1/4 x 2 5/8, 250/case.

3 [ Quantity: 99 UOM: Case No Bid
Manufacturer: |Pactiv or Equivalent |

% Clear Plastic Hinged Container, 8 1/4 x 7 3/4 x 3, 250/case.

4 | Quantity: 154 UOM: Case No Bid
Manufacturer: |Pactiv or Equiv. |

% Clear Plastic Hinged Container, Smart Lock, 5 3/4 x 6 x 3, 500/case.

5 | Quantity: 84 UOM: Case No Bid
Manufacturer: |Pactiv or Equivalent |

% Clear Plastic Hinged Container, Smart Lock, 6 1/8 x 6 1/2 x 3 1/4, 500/case.

6 | Quantity: 65 UOM: Case No Bid
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Box, Folded Take Out Box, 6 x 4.75 x 25, 300/case.
Quantity: 22 UOM: Case

~NoR

No Bid

Manufacturer: |Royal Kraft or equal

Manufacturer #: |#8

Box, Folded Take Out Box, 7.75 x 5.5 x 3.5, 160/case.
Quantity: _13  UOM: Case

(ccle) ]

Manufacturer: |Royal Kraft or equal

Manufacturer #: |#4

Napkins, Dinner, 2 ply, 15 1/2 x 17, 3000/case.
Quantity: 26 UOM: Case

O©or

No Bid

Napkins, Lunch, 1 ply, 12 x 13, 6000/case.

ork

Quantity: 60 UOM: Case Unit Price:

$34.50 | Total: |

$2,070.00 |

Supplier Notes: [#B2913

Napkin, New Natural, 100% Recycled, Non-Bleached, 13 x 12, 6000/case.
Quantity: 29 UOM: Case

PR

No Bid

Napkin, Mega Cartridge, 6/825 ct/case.
Quantity: _ 8 UOM: Case

N

No Bid

Manufacturer: | KC

Napkins, Dispenser Jr., Short Fold, 9 x 13, 8000/case.
Quantity: 25 UOM: Case

WkRE

No Bid

Napkins, Dispenser Jr., Tall Fold, 7 x 13, 10000/case.
Quantity: 78 UOM: Case

AP

No Bid

Universal Express Natural Unifold Dispenser Napkin - 8.5 X 13, 6000/case.
Quantity: 363 UOM: Case

iR

No Bid

Manufacturer #: | DX906E

Plasticware, Forks (Disposable), Medium Weight, 1000/case.

o

Quantity: 827 UOM: Case Unit Price:

$18.68| Total: |

$15,448.36 |

Supplier Notes: [#B2921

Plasticware, Knives (Disposable), Medium Weight, 1000/case.

NP

Quantity: 352 UOM: Case Unit Price:

$18.68| Total: |

$6,575.36 |

Supplier Notes: [#B2920
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R

Plasticware, Teaspoons (Disposable), Medium Weight, 1000/case.

Quantity: 840 UOM: Case Unit Price: $18.68| Total:|

$15,691.20

Supplier Notes: [#B2922

©ORrF

Plasticware, Soup Spoons (Disposable), Medium Weight, 1000/case.

Quantity: 25 UOM: Case Unit Price: $18.68| Total:|

$467.00

Supplier Notes: |#B2923

ONPF

Black Heavy Weight Fork, 1000/case.
Quantity: _36  UOM: CASE

No Bid

RPN

Black Heavy weight Knife, 1000/case.
Quantity: 35 UOM: Case

No Bid

NN

Black Heavy Weight Teaspoon, 1000/case.
Quantity: 36 UOM: Case

No Bid

WNF-

Spoon, Fork, Napkin, Straw in Plastic Bag, 500/case.
Quantity: 1045 UOM: Case

No Bid

NS )

Spork kits, White Plastic Spork Napkin and Milk Straw sealed in a bag, 1000/case.
Quantity: 581 UOM: Case

No Bid

UIN

Sporks, Medium Weight, 1000/case.

Quantity: 115 UOM: Case Unit Price: $22.12| Total:|

$2,543.80

Supplier Notes: [#B2919

OON-

Plates, Foam, 6, 1000/case.
Quantity: 34 UOM: Case

No Bid

~N-

Plates, Foam, 9, 500/case.
Quantity: 45 UOM: Case

No Bid

ONF-

Plates, Foam, 9, 3 Compartment, 500/case.
Quantity: 61 UOM: Case

No Bid

ONPF-

Plates, Foam, 10, 3 compartment, 500/case.

Quantity: 8 UOM: Case
Item Notes: 32927

No Bid

owr

Plates, Paper, 6, 1000/Case

Quantity: 146 UOM: Case
Iltem Notes: 32935

No Bid
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PWE

Plates, Paper, 9, 1200/Case

Quantity: 100 uUOM: Case
Item Notes: 32945

No Bid

NWEF

Plates, Paper, 6, 1000/case.
Quantity: 141  UOM: Case

No Bid

wWWwE

Plates, Paper, 9, 1200/case.
Quantity: 50 UOM: Case

No Bid

~rWE

Plates, Foam, 7 x 9, Oval, 1000/case.
Quantity: _15  UOM: Case

No Bid

gIWwE

Paper Food Dish, 1 Pound, 1000/case.
Quantity: 117 UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer #: |8701 SQP

WK

Paper Food Dish, 2 Pound, 1000/case.
Quantity: 162 UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer #: |8702 SQP

~Nwe

Paper Food Dish, 3 Pound, 500/case.
Quantity: 336 UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer #: |8703 SQP

cowrR

Paper Food Dish, 1/4 Pound, 1000/case.
Quantity: 126 UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer #: |8706 SQP

OWwr

Paper Food Dish, 1/2 Pound, 1000/case.
Quantity: 138 UOM: Case

No Bid

Manufacturer #: |8708 SQP

(@Y

Plates, Plastic, 10 1/2, 3 Compartment, 500/case.
Quantity: _ 6 UOM: Case

No Bid

PAPR

Plates, Plastic Coated Paper, 6, 1000/case.
Quantity: _ 6 UOM: Case

No Bid

N

5 Compartment School Lunch Tray, Minimum 8.25 x 10.25, 500/Case, DU2014501

Quantity: 2061  UOM: Case
Item Notes: 32976

No Bid

1
4
3

Trays, 3 Compartment Hinged, 9 1/2 x 9/3/4 x 3, Foam, 200/case.
Quantity: 130 UOM: Case

No Bid
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bR

Trays, 3 Compartment Hinged, Foam, 7 x 8 1/4, 200/case.

Quantity: _ 5 UOM: Case No Bid
Manufacturer: | Tenneco |
Manufacturer #: |#TH10095 |
%{ Trays, 5 Compartment School Lunch Tray, Minimum 8.25 x 10.25, 500/case.
5 | Quantity: 1390 UOM: Case No Bid
Manufacturer #: |DU2014501 |
i Trays, 5 Compartment Biodegradable, Compostable Sugarcane 8 x 10 Tray, 100/pack
6 | Quantity: 1010 UOM: Pack No Bid
i White Place Mats, 1000ct.
7 | Quantity: _ 5 UOM: Case No Bid
i Straws, Jumbo Plastic, 5 3/4 Wrapped, 500/case.
8 | Quantity: 466 UOM: Case No Bid
i Straws, Plastic, 7 3/4 Wrapped, 4/500ct.
9 | Quantity: 103 UOM: Case No Bid
% Stirrers, 5, 10/1000 ct.
0 [ Quantity: _ 9 UOM: Case No Bid
% Hairnets, Brown, 24, 144/PKG
1 | Quantity: 28 UOM: Package No Bid
% Solar Salt Water Softener, 50 Ib Bags, NSF Certified.
2 | Quantity: 104 UOM: Bag No Bid

Response Total: $51,746.13
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